

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: Warren Consolidated Schools
District-Wide Wired and Wireless Upgrades

IDS Project No.: 16210-1000 BP-T2
Date: February 21, 2017



	Complete Interactive Technologies	Avalon Technologies	Digital Age Technologies	Amcomm Telecommunications	Presidio	PCT Securities	TrendSet Communications Group	Amerinet	Fiber Link	Delta Network Services	Red Level	Vector Tech Group
Base Bid No.1	\$476,615.00	No Bid	\$306,809.00	\$425,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$266,662.70 Fiber Only	No Bid	Non-Compliant Bid	No Bid
Bid Bond	Y		Y	Y					Y		Bid Not Sealed	
Familiar Disclosure	Y		Y	Y					Y		Bid Rejected	
Iran Sanctions Act	Y		Y	Y					Y			
Mandatory Alternate	None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None
Unit Pricing	Y		Y	Y					Y			
Voluntary Alternate-1	N		Deduct (\$5,000.00)	N					N			
Voluntary Alternate-2	N		Deduct (\$23,000.00)	N					N			
Voluntary Alternate-3	N		Deduct (\$13,000.00)	N					N			
Voluntary Alternate-4	N		Add \$1,000.00	N					N			
Voluntary Alternate-5	N		Add \$2,300.00	N					N			
Base Bid No.2	\$422,244.00	No Bid	\$265,731.00	\$399,000.00	No Bid	\$391,700.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$190,801.49 Fiber Only	No Bid	Non-Compliant Bid	No Bid
Bid Bond	Y		Y	Y		Y			Y		Bid Not Sealed	
Familiar Disclosure	Y		Y	Y		Y			Y		Bid Rejected	
Iran Sanctions Act	Y		Y	Y		Y			Y			
Mandatory Alternate	None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None
Unit Pricing	Y		Y	Y		Y			Y			
Voluntary Alternate-1	N		Deduct (\$6,000.00)	N		Deduct (\$8,280.00)			N			
Voluntary Alternate-2	N		Deduct (\$16,000.00)	N		N			N			
Voluntary Alternate-3	N		Deduct (\$8,000.00)	N		N			N			
Voluntary Alternate-4	N		Add \$1,000.00	N		N			N			
Voluntary Alternate-5	N		Add \$2,300.00	N		N			N			
Base Bid No.3	No Bid	\$2,076,317.28	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,708,873.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$1,950,060.76	Non-Compliant Bid	No Bid
Bid Bond		Y			Y					Y	Bid Not Sealed	
Familiar Disclosure		Y			Y					Y	Bid Rejected	
Iran Sanctions Act		Y			Y					Y		
Mandatory Alternate		Add \$23,190.00			Add \$38,986.00					Deduct (\$53,780.18)		
Unit Pricing		Y			Y					Y		
Voluntary Alternate-1		N			Add \$41,275.00					Deduct (\$168,518.46)		
Voluntary Alternate-2		N			Add \$97,040.00					Deduct (\$83,689.20)		
Voluntary Alternate-3										Deduct (\$138,254.84)		
Voluntary Alternate-4										Deduct (\$18,230.49)		
Base Bid No.4	No Bid	\$1,482,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,145,447.00	No Bid	\$1,237,299.00	\$1,132,263.55		\$1,217,532.52	Non-Compliant Bid	\$829,917.00
Bid Bond		Y			Y		Y	Y		Y	Bid Not Sealed	Y
Familiar Disclosure		Y			Y		Y	Y		Y	Bid Rejected	Y
Iran Sanctions Act		Y			Y		Y	Y		Y		Y
Mandatory Alternate	None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None
Unit Pricing		Y			Y		Y	Y		Y		Y
Voluntary Alternate-1		N			Deduct (\$132,000.00)		N	Add \$259,560.00		Deduct (\$230,599.20)		N
Voluntary Alternate-2		N			Add \$75,360.00		N	N		Add \$9,130.63		N
Voluntary Alternate-3		N			Add \$221,806.00		N	N		Add \$49,490.13		N
Voluntary Alternate-4		N			Add \$9,900.00		N	N		Deduct (\$81,316.56)		N
Voluntary Alternate-5		N			N		N	N		Deduct (\$25,795.37)		N